

District	Control	Map Number	Name	Description	Upset Price	Sold For	To
01	024495	YV-005-893400-061	BAUER PAUL	23 HOMESTEAD DR #LOT 61	\$ 1,396.58	NO BID	-
01	024974	YV-006-679510-000	COOK, BONNIE A & DAVID M	1771 IRVINE RUN RD	\$ 3,227.25	\$ 15,000.00	PROPERTY DEVELOPMENT LLC
01	024263	YV-005-618530-000	JOHNSON DENNIS R	1225 MURRAY HILL RD	\$ 9,625.49	\$ 16,000.00	BSRE HOLDINGS LLC
01	027113	YV-674-733300-000	WALTERS, CAROL M	237 OLD PITTSFIELD RD	\$ 8,439.51	\$ 24,000.00	TIONESTA PROPERTIES LLC
04	011174	WN-004-619700-429	MACLEES ALEX	378 JACOB LN #LOT 429	\$ 643.06	NO BID	-
04	011154	WN-004-619700-136	TYLER THOMAS	915 BENJAMIN LN #LOT 136	\$ 9,530.43	NO BID	-
04	011140	WN-004-619700-118	ZANER, DAVID	821 BENJAMIN LN #LOT 118	\$ 549.99	NO BID	-
06	025421	YV-007-947630-000	VUJASINOVICH PETER & MARY JAN	6140 MORRISON HILL RD	\$ 1,828.66	\$ 15,000.00	KEITH KLINGLER
07	001635	CY-008-956000-002	ADAMS KEN	7038 OIL CREEK RD	\$ 601.75	NO BID	-
07	025305	YV-007-771800-000	CONFER, ANDREW M	380 NEWTON RD	\$ 6,492.46	NO BID	-
07	008565	TV-003-133990-000	ROSENBURGH FLORENCE P	1436 FIDDLERSGREEN RD	\$ 2,181.39	\$ 5,500.00	ERIC MILLER
11	019472	WN-589-883800-000	BROWN, STEVEN J & MAE J	27 WARREN BLVD	\$ 12,354.11	\$ 16,000.00	STEVEN SIEMINSKI
11	011917	WN-005-894200-030	CAUSER KIRK ALLEN & SMITH JONATHAN	4 SCHATZLE DR #LOT 30	\$ 780.51	NO BID	-
13	006284	TD-005-280000-210	CONTI, MARK A	168 BOBS ROAD #LOT 210	\$ 886.62	\$ 886.62	MICHAEL CHESS
13	006846	TD-265-266100-000	MERRITT EUGENE L & JUNE & AARON D	10987 ROUTE 62	\$ 2,479.76	\$ 2,479.76	KRIK O'NEILL
14	012657	WN-008-372300-029	HUDDLESON GREGORY	61 LOIS LN #LOT 29	\$ 417.62	\$ 417.62	ALAN FOX
14	003803	SH-313-112800-000	REELEY ANNA MARIE	285 SIX MILE ROAD	\$ 4,835.49	\$ 4,835.49	WEIR CORP LLC
14	021222	WN-862-571700-000	STREICH, BENJAMIN S & DEBORAH C/O NANCY OLNEY	GRIFF HILL RD & ROUTE 6	\$ 630.47	NO BID	-
15	010210	WN-002-857377-000	LITZINGER MILTON G & BARBARA H	3141 BIG FOUR RD	\$ 5,397.56	\$ 14,000.00	ERIK DAUGHARTHY
16	027695	YV-821-143500-000	LYON, TERRY & DEBRA	751 ROUTE 27	\$ 1,925.13	\$ 1,925.13	TIONESTA PROPERTIES LLC
18	004086	SH-355-769800-000	COCCARO ROBERT L	172 KEYSTONE AVE	\$ 3,571.97	NO BID	-
20	001507	CY-008-239000-001	CROSS JAMES & DONNA	COLD SPRING ROAD	\$ 744.76	NO BID	-
23	005864	TD-003-529000-013	FLEMING THOMAS	2465 COBHAM HILL RD	\$ 1,105.72	\$ 1,105.72	CHARLES CZAPSKI
23	007766	TD-313-452600-000	HALLEY WALTER E JR	0.06 ACRES	\$ 908.52	\$ 908.52	ROBERT HABJANETZ
25	021557	WN-868-932600-000	DUNHAM, SHANNON L	27 HIGH ST	\$ 4,557.15	NO BID	-
27	007201	TD-274-268810-000	STAPP, WR & VOLA H ETAL	160 MAIN STREET	\$ 14,846.10	\$ 14,846.10	BSRE HOLDINGS LLC
31	016222	WN-575-424400-000	DIPIERRO ANZIETTA C	620 W 5TH AVE	\$ 1,283.22	NO BID	-
31	016201	WN-575-289200-000	MILLER MELISSA	412 W 5TH AVE	\$ 26,189.72	NO BID	-
31	016225	WN-575-428600-000	WHYTE, BEATRICE L	611 W 5TH AVE	\$ 3,734.74	\$ 3,734.74	CLIFFORD GEIGER
32	014267	WN-499-625800-000	CAPELLO, DONNA L	18 EDDY STREET	\$ 6,133.80	NO BID	-
32	014272	WN-499-632600-000	CAPPELLO THOMAS A	ALLEGHENY AVENUE	\$ 1,029.57	NO BID	-
32	014278	WN-499-636100-000	CAPPELLO THOMAS A	1414 ALLEGHENY AVENUE	\$ 7,807.69	\$ 7,807.69	WEIR CORP LLC
32	016115	WN-574-737100-000	HUNT, DEBORAH L	1103 SPRING STREET	\$ 4,311.43	NO BID	-
32	016036	WN-574-573900-000	LINDSEY MARK	921 STONE HILL RD	\$ 3,822.78	NO BID	-
32	016110	WN-574-731600-000	PFEIFER, MYRON A ET UX	1024 SPRING STREET	\$ 3,565.44	NO BID	-
33	018297	WN-584-861300-000	DSV SPV3 LLC	306 PROSPECT ST	\$ 13,942.37	\$ 13,942.37	ARTHUR STEWART
33	018111	WN-584-587200-000	EASTON KIMBERLY JOE & RODGERS MARGARET ANN	325 PROSPECT ST	\$ 10,271.14	NO BID	-
34	018968	WN-588-175800-000	EHRGOTT DALLAS	202 NORTH IRVINE STREET	\$ 14,526.71	NO BID	-
34	019234	WN-588-772800-000	MINWEASER ASHLEY I & BUNCE JOEY L	PENNSYLVANIA AVE E	\$ 1,599.01	NO BID	-
36	018282	WN-584-848600-000	CONSTABLE, ROBERT & ANDREA	114 BUCHANAN STREET	\$ 8,880.87	NO BID	-
36	018332	WN-584-899700-000	MOATS, ARNELL R II	7 HINKLE STREET	\$ 8,254.18	NO BID	-
						<u>\$ 158,389.76</u>	